
[[GRASSY CREEK]] VOLVO L180G 22208 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP426937
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: GRASSY CREEK

160 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - MILLS RIVER215 FANNING FIELDS RDMILLS RIVER, NCUS  28759Contact: BRANDON DRAKEbrandon.drake@ascendummachinery.comT: 8(286)687-0620F: (828)687-0622
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Clutchand/or bushing/bearing wear isindicated. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO1672Unique No: 10577028Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 31 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO1672 [WUSCAR] 05910376 (Generated: 07/31/2023 17:20:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON DRAKE - VOLVO1672

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP426937 VCE69635 --- ---Sample Date 24 Jul 2023 08 Jan 2015 --- ---Machine Hours 6318 2007 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 31.2 27.84 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 5 9 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 6 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 55 169 --- ---Copper ppm 294 9 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 4 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 2 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 1 4 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1152 186 --- ---Magnesium ppm 9 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 499 20 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 521 292 --- ---Barium ppm 0 2 --- ---Boron ppm 65 82 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1672 [WUSCAR] 05910376 (Generated: 07/31/2023 17:20:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON DRAKE - VOLVO1672
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180G 22208\Transmission (Auto) [VCP426937] 24 Jul 2023 @ 6318.0 hrs

