
VOLVO L260H VCP 340619 (S/N NOT GIVEN) - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP340619
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

SARGENT DOCKS5606 N WESTERVELT RDSAGINAW, MIUS  48604Contact: JC NUDDEJCNUDDE@SARGENTDOCKS.COMT: (989)752-3101F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SARSAGUnique No: 10577287Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 31 Jul 2023
Report Id: SARSAG [WUSCAR] 05910635 (Generated: 07/31/2023 21:54:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JC NUDDE - SARSAG

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP340619 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 May 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1490 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.5 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 11 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 11 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 78 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3918 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1653 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1291 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 129 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SARSAG [WUSCAR] 05910635 (Generated: 07/31/2023 21:54:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JC NUDDE - SARSAG
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L260H VCP 340619 (S/N NOT GIVEN)\Front Axle [VCP340619] 26 May 2023 @ 1490.0 hrs

