
[[SWA309970 S FL EXC]] VOLVO A40G 352506 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP420580
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SWA309970 S FL EXC

SOUTH FLORIDA EXCAVATION1455  RAIL HEAD BLVD STE 3NAPLES, FLUS  34110-8407Contact: ROB ANDERSONCHOOEH@EMBARQMAIL.COM;KJ_GERRARD@YAHOO.COM;ROBDIGSDIRT@AOL.COMT: (239)596-8111F: (239)596-8112
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Weadvise that you check for the sourceof water entry. The oil change at thetime of sampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. Appearance ishazy. Elemental levels of silicon (Si)and aluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. There is amoderate concentration of waterpresent in the oil. The oil viscosity ishigher than normal.

Depot: SOUNAPFLUnique No: 10578242Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 02 Aug 2023
Report Id: SOUNAPFL [WUSCAR] 05911590 (Generated: 08/02/2023 12:41:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROB ANDERSON - SOUNAPFL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420580 VCP343790 --- ---Sample Date 22 Jul 2023 16 Oct 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 5710 2346 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 286 52.5 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.422 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 147 50 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 7 5 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 361 787 --- ---Copper ppm 4 5 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 69 21 --- ---Chromium ppm 4 12 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 6 5 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 3 --- ---Titanium ppm 2 1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 1 --- ---Manganese ppm 6 25 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 782 200 --- ---Magnesium ppm 53 11 --- ---Zinc ppm 65 28 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1008 2332 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 126 236 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SOUNAPFL [WUSCAR] 05911590 (Generated: 08/02/2023 12:41:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROB ANDERSON - SOUNAPFL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352506\Rear Axle [VCP420580] 22 Jul 2023 @ 5710.0 hrs

