
[[301300-20 JHS BUILD]] TAKEUCHI TB235 123600202 - FRONT RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP420606
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 301300-20 JHS BUILD

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: TODD LARKtlark@altaequipfl.comT: F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. We advise that youinspect for the source(s) of wear. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. Please specifythe brand, type, and viscosity of theoil on your next sample.Gear wear isindicated. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The oil isno longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10578261Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 01 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05911609 (Generated: 08/01/2023 15:58:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420606 --- --- ---Sample Date 25 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2419 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 1315 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.301 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2451 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 8 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10000 --- --- ---Copper ppm 43 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 107 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 116 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 13 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 35 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 8 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 85 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 716 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 37 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 83 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 791 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 128 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05911609 (Generated: 08/01/2023 15:58:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TB235 123600202\Front Right Final Drive [VCP420606] 25 Jul 2023 @ 2419.0 hrs

