
VOLVO A40G 341237 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP411920
Oil Type: DEXRON III
Job No:

HANSON SOUTHEASTNC HWY 117ERWIN, NCUS  28339Contact: Service Manager
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofmetal. Resample at the next serviceinterval to monitor.Moderateconcentration of visible metalpresent. All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in thefluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: HANERWUnique No: 10578275Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 01 Aug 2023
Report Id: HANERW [WUSCAR] 05911623 (Generated: 08/03/2023 18:57:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - HANERW

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP411920 VCP421176 VCP377638 ---Sample Date 27 Jul 2023 24 Mar 2023 20 Oct 2022 ---Machine Hours 7468 6717 6097 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd N/A ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.2 28.6 28.1 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 7 5 12 ---Sodium ppm 4 3 3 ---Potassium ppm 3 2 8 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 24 11 31 ---Copper ppm 13 8 27 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 1 1 3 ---Aluminum ppm 14 6 16 ---Chromium ppm 0 0 0 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Nickel ppm 2 <1 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 67 71 73 ---Magnesium ppm 0 3 <1 ---Zinc ppm 0 2 2 ---Phosphorus ppm 191 194 181 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 110 95 75 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HANERW [WUSCAR] 05911623 (Generated: 08/03/2023 18:57:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - HANERW
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 341237\Transmission (Auto) [VCP411920] 27 Jul 2023 @ 7468.0 hrs

