
[[224972 WM]] VOLVO L220G 12593 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP403939
Oil Type: ? WM CANADA 15W40
Job No: 224972 WM

PACWEST MACHINERY8207 SOUTH 216TH STREETKENT, WAUS  98032Contact: CHRIS COPELANDccopeland@pacwestmachinery.comT: (800)935-5933F: (509)534-5286
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Tests indicate that there is no fuelpresent in the oil. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO1271Unique No: 10578793Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 02 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 05912141 (Generated: 08/02/2023 13:01:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS COPELAND - VOLVO1271

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP403939 VCP239103 VCP259186 VCP242104Sample Date 12 Jul 2023 17 Aug 2020 14 Feb 2020 27 Feb 2019Machine Hours 7856 6904 6528 5033Oil Hours 0 0 0 400Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION NORMAL ATTENTION NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.6 13.2 13.8 13.11Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.1 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 76 76 76 85
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.1 0.6 0.3Nitration (PA) % 51 43 80 70Sulfation (PA) % 60 62 59 62Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.4 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 6 4 7Sodium ppm 2 6 96 7Potassium ppm <1 <1 3 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 24 4 15 10Copper ppm 8 1 5 7Lead ppm <1 0 <1 0Tin ppm <1 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 6 0 3 3Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 36 35 26 40Nickel ppm 3 <1 2 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 9 <1Silver ppm 0 3 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1445 1475 1809 1717Magnesium ppm 423 480 361 514Zinc ppm 989 944 921 840Phosphorus ppm 817 843 799 726Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 64 132 33 30

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 05912141 (Generated: 08/02/2023 13:01:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS COPELAND - VOLVO1271
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220G 12593\Diesel Engine [VCP403939] 12 Jul 2023 @ 7856.0 hrs

