
[[322281]] TAKEUCHI TL8 200808345 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP383209
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 322281

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL ELZERMANpaul.elzerman@altaequipment.comT: (248)356-5200F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. We recommendthat you drain the oil from thecomponent if this has not alreadybeen done. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor this condition.The fluid was not specified, however,a fluid match indicates that this fluidis SAE 30 Diesel Engine Oil.  Pleaseconfirm the oil type and grade, andspecify the brand of the oil on yournext sample.Metal levels are typicalfor a new component breaking in.There is a high amount of fuelpresent in the oil. Tests confirm thepresence of fuel in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Fuel ispresent in the oil and is lowering theviscosity. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 10578794Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 02 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 05912142 (Generated: 08/02/2023 12:06:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP383209 --- --- ---Sample Date 28 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 841 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.5 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 87 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 94 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 61 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 10.8 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 21 --- --- ---Copper ppm 8 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 44 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1655 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 468 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1132 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 900 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 38 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 05912142 (Generated: 08/02/2023 12:06:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TL8 200808345\Diesel Engine [VCP383209] 28 Jul 2023 @ 841.0 hrs

