
VOLVO EC350 314347 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP411941
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90
Job No:

113 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - GARNER3561 JONES SAUSAGE ROADGARNER, NCUS  27529Contact: TRENT BROADWELLtrent.broadwell@ascendummachinery.comT: (919)661-8817F: (919)661-9038
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0157Unique No: 10579433Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 02 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0157 [WUSCAR] 05912781 (Generated: 08/07/2023 08:24:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TRENT BROADWELL - VOLVO0157

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP411941 VCP409955 --- ---Sample Date 29 Jul 2023 01 May 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 2173 1698 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 91.9 80.5 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 73 38 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 1 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 536 233 --- ---Copper ppm <1 <1 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 21 11 --- ---Chromium ppm 16 10 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 2 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 2 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 5 3 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 79 34 --- ---Magnesium ppm 10 11 --- ---Zinc ppm 50 32 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1562 1698 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 196 206 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0157 [WUSCAR] 05912781 (Generated: 08/07/2023 08:24:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TRENT BROADWELL - VOLVO0157
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350 314347\Front Left Final Drive [VCP411941] 29 Jul 2023 @ 2173.0 hrs

