
[TMR-OCALA 6TH ST [SPM567633]] VOLVO L90G 3185 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP412614
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: SPM567633

TRADEMARK METALS RECYCLING - OCALA - 6TH STREET2402 NW 6TH STREETOCALA, FLUS  34475Contact: RYAN BOWDEN
T: (352)351-3383F: (352)351-4439
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: TRAOCA6Unique No: 10585683Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 03 Aug 2023
Report Id: TRAOCA6 [WUSCAR] 05913769 (Generated: 08/03/2023 15:59:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAOCA6

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412614 DJJ0018301 VCP381502 VCP346516Sample Date 26 Jul 2023 14 Apr 2023 31 Oct 2022 23 Feb 2022Machine Hours 12394 12187 11911 11414Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd N/A Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 52.1 51.8 52.4 138
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 11 11 11 6Sodium ppm 5 4 6 0Potassium ppm 0 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 9 8 10Copper ppm <1 0 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 1 1 1 1Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 3Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4002 3630 3796 3311Magnesium ppm 21 22 18 22Zinc ppm 1640 1477 1446 1275Phosphorus ppm 1296 1215 1175 1113Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 109 116 124 27

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TRAOCA6 [WUSCAR] 05913769 (Generated: 08/03/2023 15:59:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAOCA6
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90G 3185\Front Axle [VCP412614] 26 Jul 2023 @ 12394.0 hrs

