
[[64269 SHARED SVC]] GROVE RT880 236850 - TRANSMISSION (MANUAL)

Sample No: VCP413028
Oil Type: TDTO FLUID SAE 20
Job No: 64269 SHARED SVC

COWIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY INC - GUNTERSVILLE15101 ALABAMA HWY 20MADISON, ALUS  35756Contact: RANDY HARRISRHARRIS@COWIN.COMT: (256)298-2322F: (256)355-5250
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. Clutch wear isindicated. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thefluid is no longer serviceable as aresult of the abnormal and/or severewear.

Depot: COWMADUnique No: 10585711Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 04 Aug 2023
Report Id: COWMAD [WUSCAR] 05913797 (Generated: 08/08/2023 12:17:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY HARRIS - COWMAD

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413028 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2245 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 54.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 --- --- ---Copper ppm 39 --- --- ---Lead ppm 156 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3324 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 27 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1339 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1150 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 51 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COWMAD [WUSCAR] 05913797 (Generated: 08/08/2023 12:17:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY HARRIS - COWMAD
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	GROVE GROVE RT880 236850\Transmission (Manual) [VCP413028] 26 Jul 2023 @ 2245.0 hrs

