
VOLVO A60H 350150 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP392561
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

403 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - FARGO3739 38TH ST SW, SUITE EFARGO, NDUS  58104Contact: SCOTT HANSONscott.hanson@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (701)356-4072
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Check forlow coolant level. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. Sodium and/orpotassium levels are high. Fuelcontent negligible. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: ASCFARUnique No: 10586268Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 07 Aug 2023
Report Id: ASCFAR [WUSCAR] 05914354 (Generated: 08/07/2023 10:47:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT HANSON - ASCFAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP392561 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3000 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.7 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 63 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.9 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 81 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 62 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 257 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 20 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 --- --- ---Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 8 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 85 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 4 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1465 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 643 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 805 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 678 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 145 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ASCFAR [WUSCAR] 05914354 (Generated: 08/07/2023 10:47:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT HANSON - ASCFAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 350150\Diesel Engine [VCP392561] 26 Jul 2023 @ 3000.0 hrs

