
[[SPM580155]] VOLVO EC380E 314966 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP420037
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SPM580155

UNITED SCRAP1545 S CICERO AVECICERO, ILUS  60804Contact: RON LUCHTENBURGrluchten@unitedscrap.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.The chromium level isabnormal. All other component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The amount and size ofparticulates present in the system areacceptable. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: UNICICILUnique No: 10586398Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 04 Aug 2023
Report Id: UNICICIL [WUSCAR] 05914484 (Generated: 08/04/2023 13:32:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RON LUCHTENBURG - UNICICIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420037 VCP422177 VCP401613 VCP387486Sample Date 14 Jul 2023 07 Jun 2023 20 Jan 2023 14 Nov 2022Machine Hours 4982 4682 1858 2125Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 39.8 43.5 41.8 41.4Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.40 0.49 0.52 0.47
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 1557 6721 1939 2942Particles >6µm 462 1863 630 404Particles >14µm 47 53 76 20ISO 4406:1999 (c) 18/16/13 20/18/13 18/16/13 19/16/11Silicon ppm 3 1 2 4Sodium ppm <1 0 0 <1Potassium ppm <1 <1 1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 4 4 4Copper ppm 7 2 7 8Lead ppm 0 1 <1 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm <1 0 0 <1Chromium ppm 24 4 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 0Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 0 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 78 131 118 93Magnesium ppm 2 53 4 <1Zinc ppm 449 949 534 499Phosphorus ppm 348 732 400 399Barium ppm 0 1 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: UNICICIL [WUSCAR] 05914484 (Generated: 08/04/2023 13:32:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RON LUCHTENBURG - UNICICIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380E 314966\Hydraulic System [VCP420037] 14 Jul 2023 @ 4982.0 hrs

