
[[19161 GFL]] VOLVO L120F 66421 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP417733
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 19161 GFL

117 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - GREENVILLE2002 N GREENE STGREENVILLE, NCUS  27834Contact: BRANDON JENKINSBRANDON.JENKINS@ASCENDUMMACHINERY.COMT: F: (704)494-8197
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Check forlow coolant level. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Sodium and/orpotassium levels are high. Elementallevel of silicon (Si) above normalindicating ingress of seal material.The BN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: VOLVO8769Unique No: 10586954Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 07 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05915040 (Generated: 08/08/2023 14:57:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417733 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 25708 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.5 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.1 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 81 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.6 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 78 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 63 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 50 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 111 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 49 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 57 --- --- ---Copper ppm 11 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 12 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 45 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1943 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 513 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1229 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 978 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 28 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05915040 (Generated: 08/08/2023 14:57:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120F 66421\Diesel Engine [VCP417733] 24 Jul 2023 @ 25708.0 hrs

