
[ASCENDUM MACHINERY/250 HOUR CSA [19053]] CATERPILLAR CS433C 458 (S/N 3TM00296) - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP425915
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 19053

TRIANGLE GRADING AND PAVING INC1521 Huffman Mill RdBURLINGTON, NCUS  27216Contact: KAREN HILLIARDkhilliard@trianglegradingpaving.comT: (336)584-1745F: (336)584-0145
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: TRIBURUnique No: 10587187Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 05 Aug 2023
Report Id: TRIBUR [WUSCAR] 05915273 (Generated: 08/07/2023 15:51:25) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP425915 VCP0007085 VCP0000307 ---Sample Date 25 Jul 2023 08 Feb 2023 19 Jan 2022 ---Machine Hours 7928 7800 7707 ---Oil Hours 0 7800 7707 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed N/A ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.4 43.7 41.7 ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.56 1.09 1.331 ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 103443 89492 98531 ---Particles >6µm 16010 8411 7421 ---Particles >14µm 130 67 57 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/21/14 24/20/13 24/20/13 ---Silicon ppm 6 5 4 ---Sodium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Potassium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 17 15 ---Copper ppm 49 70 52 ---Lead ppm 1 2 1 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 0 <1 1 ---Chromium ppm 0 0 0 ---Molybdenum ppm 2 3 3 ---Nickel ppm <1 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 173 673 657 ---Magnesium ppm 93 468 475 ---Zinc ppm 467 1019 1061 ---Phosphorus ppm 394 862 892 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm <1 3 8 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TRIBUR [WUSCAR] 05915273 (Generated: 08/07/2023 15:51:28) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR CATERPILLAR CS433C 458 (S/N 3TM00296)\Hydraulic System [VCP425915] 25 Jul 2023 @ 7928.0 hrs

