
[[19123 KOPPERS]] VOLVO L150H 6956 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP414187
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 19123 KOPPERS

117 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - GREENVILLE2002 N GREENE STGREENVILLE, NCUS  27834Contact: BRANDON JENKINSBRANDON.JENKINS@ASCENDUMMACHINERY.COMT: F: (704)494-8197
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The condition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO8769Unique No: 10587189Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 04 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05915275 (Generated: 08/04/2023 12:37:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414187 VCP424391 VCP331432 VCP328536Sample Date 13 Jul 2023 27 Apr 2023 01 Dec 2021 07 Oct 2021Machine Hours 5558 5052 2031 1681Oil Hours 0 800 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.9 43.1 41.1 41.1Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.32 0.26 0.392 0.341
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 2139 3350 7231 19793Particles >6µm 538 725 217 5900Particles >14µm 45 51 25 343ISO 4406:1999 (c) 18/16/13 19/17/13 20/15/12 21/20/16Silicon ppm 2 2 1 <1Sodium ppm <1 2 2 2Potassium ppm 1 3 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 4 2 2Copper ppm 2 2 3 3Lead ppm 1 2 <1 3Tin ppm <1 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 0 <1 0 0Chromium ppm 1 2 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 0 0 0 0Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 0 <1 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 53 48 50 57Magnesium ppm <1 <1 0 0Zinc ppm 426 443 397 423Phosphorus ppm 324 348 329 329Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 3

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05915275 (Generated: 08/04/2023 12:37:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6956\Hydraulic System [VCP414187] 13 Jul 2023 @ 5558.0 hrs

