
[[19161 GFL]] VOLVO L120F 66421 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP417739
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 19161 GFL

117 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - GREENVILLE2002 N GREENE STGREENVILLE, NCUS  27834Contact: BRANDON JENKINSBRANDON.JENKINS@ASCENDUMMACHINERY.COMT: F: (704)494-8197
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend you service the filters onthis component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Appearance is milky. There is amoderate amount of particulatespresent in the oil. There is amoderate concentration of waterpresent in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid.

Depot: VOLVO8769Unique No: 10587197Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 09 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05915283 (Generated: 08/09/2023 09:19:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417739 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 25708 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.5 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.43 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.325 --- --- ---Particles >4µm 2262 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 1231 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 210 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 18/17/15 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 75 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 22 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 437 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 332 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05915283 (Generated: 08/09/2023 09:19:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120F 66421\Hydraulic System [VCP417739] 24 Jul 2023 @ 25708.0 hrs

