
[ASCENDUM MACHINERY [19248]] VOLVO L150H RL72 (S/N 7053) - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP412182
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 19248

HILCO TRANSPORT7700 KENMONT RDGREENSBORO, NCUS  27409Contact: MIKE LAUGHEADmlaughead@hilcotransport.comT: (336)273-9441F: (336)273-9701
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: HILGREVCUnique No: 10587585Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 06 Aug 2023
Report Id: HILGREVC [WUSCAR] 05915671 (Generated: 08/08/2023 03:49:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE LAUGHEAD - HILGREVC

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412182 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3645 --- --- ---Oil Hours 3645 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.2 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 15 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 34 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 5 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3959 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 27 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1642 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1314 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 137 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HILGREVC [WUSCAR] 05915671 (Generated: 08/08/2023 03:49:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE LAUGHEAD - HILGREVC
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H RL72 (S/N 7053)\Rear Axle [VCP412182] 20 Jul 2023 @ 3645.0 hrs

