
[ASCENDUM MACHINERY/500 HOUR CSA [19208]] VOLVO EC250E 2012 (S/N 310483) - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP414139
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 19208

TRIANGLE GRADING AND PAVING INC1521 Huffman Mill RdBURLINGTON, NCUS  27216Contact: ADAM CORBETTwacorbett@trianglegradingpaving.comT: F: (336)584-0145
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The leadlevel is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: TRIBURUnique No: 10587606Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 06 Aug 2023
Report Id: TRIBUR [WUSCAR] 05915692 (Generated: 08/07/2023 14:38:53) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414139 ASC0000399 VCP0006129 VCP0002046Sample Date 19 Jul 2023 26 Apr 2023 16 Jan 2023 30 Aug 2022Machine Hours 3633 5502 5016 4523Oil Hours 0 486 493 521Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 143 307 237 69.01
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 2 56 140 440Sodium ppm 2 1 1 5Potassium ppm <1 <1 5 18
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 31 340 716 1677Copper ppm 10 <1 <1 2Lead ppm 134 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 17 53 180Chromium ppm <1 2 6 14Molybdenum ppm 7 <1 1 2Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 1 2 7Silver ppm 0 0 4 <1Manganese ppm <1 3 6 13Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 132 15 20 31Magnesium ppm 4 2 4 6Zinc ppm 49 4 14 18Phosphorus ppm 1074 1011 1216 2004Barium ppm 0 0 1 2Boron ppm 114 211 190 184

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TRIBUR [WUSCAR] 05915692 (Generated: 08/07/2023 14:38:56) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHRISTOPHER CANIPE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250E 2012 (S/N 310483)\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP414139] 19 Jul 2023 @ 3633.0 hrs

