
[[SCOTT HASLAM]] ELTEC E7108 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP315284
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SCOTT HASLAM

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC188 PERRY ROADBANGOR, MEUS  04401Contact: MIKE MORINmmorin@chadwick-baross.comT: (207)735-0856F: (207)941-0856
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. We recommendthat you drain the oil from thecomponent if this has not alreadybeen done. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a high amount offuel present in the oil. Tests confirmthe presence of fuel in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Fuel ispresent in the oil and is lowering theviscosity. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0007Unique No: 10587694Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 07 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0007 [WUSCAR] 05915780 (Generated: 08/07/2023 12:18:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MORIN - VOLVO0007

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP315284 VCP424088 VCP365930 VCP328029Sample Date 28 Jul 2023 25 Jul 2023 07 Jun 2023 30 Mar 2022Machine Hours 3249 0 2980 141Oil Hours 70 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed N/A N/ASample Status SEVERE SEVERE SEVERE ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.4 8.7 9.1 6.4Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.2 9.0 7.4 3.0Oxidation (PA) % 77 81 70 37
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.7 1.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 58 80 88 29Sulfation (PA) % 60 61 58 47Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 10.4 17.6 18.7 <1.0Silicon ppm 3 3 2 3Sodium ppm 1 2 1 6Potassium ppm <1 0 0 12
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 13 25 12Copper ppm <1 1 <1 9Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 <1 <1 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 37 34 35 4Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1551 1389 970 178Magnesium ppm 478 440 489 48Zinc ppm 1073 925 815 493Phosphorus ppm 889 767 755 424Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 48 38 17 9

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0007 [WUSCAR] 05915780 (Generated: 08/07/2023 12:18:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MORIN - VOLVO0007
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ELTEC ELTEC E7108\Diesel Engine [VCP315284] 28 Jul 2023 @ 3249.0 hrs

