
[[SWO-064552]] VOLVO A45G 352134 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP416723
Oil Type: DEXRON III
Job No: SWO-064552

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10588387Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 07 Aug 2023
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05916473 (Generated: 08/07/2023 16:53:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416723 VCP414245 VCP401942 VCP393618Sample Date 31 Jul 2023 31 May 2023 04 Apr 2023 06 Feb 2023Machine Hours 7719 7234 6763 6236Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.8 28.6 28.2 28.4
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 3 2 2 3Sodium ppm <1 0 1 2Potassium ppm <1 1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 9 6 11Copper ppm 30 22 12 25Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 3 2 1 3Aluminum ppm 6 3 3 5Chromium ppm <1 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 6 4 2 4Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 88 86 91 71Magnesium ppm 4 4 10 2Zinc ppm 10 10 0 6Phosphorus ppm 167 160 177 191Barium ppm 0 2 0 2Boron ppm 101 76 78 99

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05916473 (Generated: 08/07/2023 16:53:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352134\Transmission (Auto) [VCP416723] 31 Jul 2023 @ 7719.0 hrs

