
[[W03006932 EARTH RES]] TAKEUCHI TL8 200809942 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP409439
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: W03006932 EARTH RES

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO INC - FREDERICKSBURG358 KINGS HWYFREDERICKSBURG, VAUS  22405Contact: TIM LAMBERTtlambert@mcclung-logan.comT: (540)684-4339F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Metal levels are typical fora new component breaking in. Lightfuel dilution occurring. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Fuel ispresent in the oil and is lowering theviscosity. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: MCCFREUnique No: 10588453Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 08 Aug 2023
Report Id: MCCFRE [WUSCAR] 05916539 (Generated: 08/08/2023 09:07:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TIM LAMBERT - MCCFRE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409439 --- --- ---Sample Date 03 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 728 --- --- ---Oil Hours 357 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.4 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.8 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 53 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 62 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 50 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 2.9 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 41 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 4 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1402 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 508 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1056 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 836 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 44 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MCCFRE [WUSCAR] 05916539 (Generated: 08/08/2023 09:07:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TIM LAMBERT - MCCFRE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TL8 200809942\Diesel Engine [VCP409439] 03 Aug 2023 @ 728.0 hrs

