
[[G07521]] VOLVO A30G 740081 - BRAKE COOLING SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP435217
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: G07521

OCEAN COUNTY LANDFILLPO BOX 207BELLFORD, NJUS  07718Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (732)787-0226F: (732)495-6225
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: OCEBEDUnique No: 10588909Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 08 Aug 2023
Report Id: OCEBED [WUSCAR] 05916995 (Generated: 08/08/2023 10:55:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - OCEBED

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435217 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 10546 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 51.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 19 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 35 --- --- ---Copper ppm 167 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1597 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 28 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 776 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 637 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 26 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: OCEBED [WUSCAR] 05916995 (Generated: 08/08/2023 10:55:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - OCEBED
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 740081\Brake Cooling System [VCP435217] 02 Aug 2023 @ 10546.0 hrs

