
[[SWA311351 RANGO]] VOLVO A60H 350070 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP409121
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SWA311351 RANGO

ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT613 E STEVENSON RDOTTAWA, ILUS  61350Contact: KEVIN SKRTICHKEVIN.SKRTICH@ALTAEQUIPMENT.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The nickellevel has decreased, but is stillabnormal. All other component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO5055Unique No: 10589087Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 08 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO5055 [WUSCAR] 05917173 (Generated: 08/08/2023 11:13:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN SKRTICH - VOLVO5055

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409121 VCP382821 --- ---Sample Date 21 Jul 2023 28 Apr 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 11816 11182 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.6 13.1 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.2 8.3 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 59 67 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.8 1.3 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 67 77 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 54 61 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 9 27 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 24 40 --- ---Copper ppm 4 10 --- ---Lead ppm 1 1 --- ---Tin ppm 1 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 88 66 --- ---Nickel ppm 9 14 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1129 1150 --- ---Magnesium ppm 905 839 --- ---Zinc ppm 1202 1162 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1016 912 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 28 16 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5055 [WUSCAR] 05917173 (Generated: 08/08/2023 11:13:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN SKRTICH - VOLVO5055
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 350070\Diesel Engine [VCP409121] 21 Jul 2023 @ 11816.0 hrs

