
[[SWA276465 RANGO]] VOLVO A45G 352403 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP407618
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W80
Job No: SWA276465 RANGO

ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT613 E STEVENSON RDOTTAWA, ILUS  61350Contact: ALEX MARCOALEXANDER.MARCO@ALTG.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Gear wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Confirm oiltype. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO5055Unique No: 10589829Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 08 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO5055 [WUSCAR] 05917915 (Generated: 08/08/2023 18:45:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALEX MARCO - VOLVO5055

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407618 VCP387391 VCP385851 VCP371607Sample Date 02 Jun 2023 07 Feb 2023 11 Nov 2022 06 Jul 2022Machine Hours 6060 5055 4478 3984Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ATTENTION NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 149 53.6 56.0 108
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 17 8 5 9Sodium ppm 2 <1 1 <1Potassium ppm <1 <1 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 599 620 307 173Copper ppm 4 5 3 2Lead ppm <1 0 <1 0Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 3 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm 11 7 3 2Molybdenum ppm 15 12 6 4Nickel ppm 6 5 2 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm 6 6 4 3Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2659 50 182 9Magnesium ppm 32 3 4 <1Zinc ppm 1127 40 99 36Phosphorus ppm 1446 2003 2162 821Barium ppm 0 0 0 4Boron ppm 139 164 156 37

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5055 [WUSCAR] 05917915 (Generated: 08/08/2023 18:45:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALEX MARCO - VOLVO5055
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352403\Drop Box [VCP407618] 02 Jun 2023 @ 6060.0 hrs

