
[[580674 APTIM]] VOLVO A35G 340227 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP417007
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 580674 APTIM

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal.Confirm oil type. The condition of theoil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10589839Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 08 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05917925 (Generated: 08/09/2023 12:43:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417007 VCP395750 --- ---Sample Date 27 Jul 2023 01 Feb 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 7611 6647 --- ---Oil Hours 4000 2000 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.9 45.9 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 29 30 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 4 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 124 133 --- ---Copper ppm 3 3 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 18 24 --- ---Chromium ppm 1 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 6 9 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 3 4 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 833 886 --- ---Magnesium ppm 31 30 --- ---Zinc ppm 449 486 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1682 1730 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 112 142 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05917925 (Generated: 08/09/2023 12:43:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35G 340227\Drop Box [VCP417007] 27 Jul 2023 @ 7611.0 hrs

