
[[SWO-064541]] VOLVO A60H 350051 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP369318
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SWO-064541

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10589849Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 08 Aug 2023
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05917935 (Generated: 08/08/2023 16:00:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP369318 VCP424541 VCP393990 VCP364261Sample Date 03 Aug 2023 28 Apr 2023 21 Dec 2022 31 Aug 2022Machine Hours 6858 6390 5828 5303Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 278 278 138 140
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 4 3 1 2Sodium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Potassium ppm 2 1 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 66 65 21 16Copper ppm 1 <1 <1 2Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 0 <1 0 0Chromium ppm 2 2 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 3 3 3 3Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm <1 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 2 2 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 86 69 60 100Magnesium ppm 18 17 26 17Zinc ppm 60 54 86 95Phosphorus ppm 1281 1086 1016 920Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 234 174 52 62

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05917935 (Generated: 08/08/2023 16:00:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 350051\Rear Axle [VCP369318] 03 Aug 2023 @ 6858.0 hrs

