
[[SWA311351 RANGO]] VOLVO A60H 350070 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP409478
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SWA311351 RANGO

ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT613 E STEVENSON RDOTTAWA, ILUS  61350Contact: KEVIN SKRTICHKEVIN.SKRTICH@ALTAEQUIPMENT.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. All componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO5055Unique No: 10589886Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 09 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO5055 [WUSCAR] 05917972 (Generated: 08/09/2023 10:10:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN SKRTICH - VOLVO5055

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409478 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 11816 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 75.0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 26 --- --- ---Copper ppm 19 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 59 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 98 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1282 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 826 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1179 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1066 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 28 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5055 [WUSCAR] 05917972 (Generated: 08/09/2023 10:10:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN SKRTICH - VOLVO5055
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 350070\Transmission [VCP409478] 21 Jul 2023 @ 11816.0 hrs

