
[[064267 MID GA PROPER]] TAKEUCHI TL12V2 412002890 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP388225
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: 064267 MID GA PROPER

COWIN EQUIPMENT - ATLANTA5710 RIVERVIEW RDMABLETON, GAUS  30126Contact: MIKE ANDREWSmandrews@cowin.comT: (404)690-7210F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The ironlevel has decreased, but is stillabnormal. All other component wearrates are normal. Moderateconcentration of visible dirt/debrispresent in the oil. The condition ofthe oil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: COWMABUnique No: 10601791Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 12 Aug 2023
Report Id: COWMAB [WUSCAR] 05921844 (Generated: 08/12/2023 14:07:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE ANDREWS - COWMAB

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP388225 VCP388208 --- ---Sample Date 08 Aug 2023 01 Aug 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 0 1195 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A N/A --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL SEVERE --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 143 158 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 32 156 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 7 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 8 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 712 1948 --- ---Copper ppm 1 4 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 8 42 --- ---Chromium ppm 8 24 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 2 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 11 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 4 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 8 18 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 69 13 --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 4 --- ---Zinc ppm 55 73 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 519 277 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 6 1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COWMAB [WUSCAR] 05921844 (Generated: 08/12/2023 14:07:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE ANDREWS - COWMAB
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TL12V2 412002890\Rear Axle [VCP388225] 08 Aug 2023 @ .0 hrs

