
[[A10773 WM NORTHAMPTO]] VOLVO L120H 633108 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP421716
Oil Type: MOBIL ATF
Job No: A10773 WM NORTHAMPTO

HOFFMAN EQUIPMENT - LIONVILLE120 GORDON DRIVELIONVILLE, PAUS  19341Contact: JIM FEHRjim.fehr@hoffmanequip.comT: (610)363-9200F: (610)594-0829
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8879Unique No: 10601822Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 12 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8879 [WUSCAR] 05921875 (Generated: 08/12/2023 14:16:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM FEHR - VOLVO8879

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP421716 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1960 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1960 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 32 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 83 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 8 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 203 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 96 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8879 [WUSCAR] 05921875 (Generated: 08/12/2023 14:16:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM FEHR - VOLVO8879
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 633108\Transmission (Auto) [VCP421716] 26 Jul 2023 @ 1960.0 hrs

