
[[SPM593014]] VOLVO L120H 633335 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP420189
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SPM593014

OZINGA BROS INC19001 OLD LAGRANDE RDMOKENA, ILUS  60448Contact: ED JONGSMA
T: (708)326-4200F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thealuminum level is abnormal. All othermetal levels are typical for a newcomponent breaking in. Fuel contentnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: OZIMOKVCUnique No: 10601878Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Aug 2023
Report Id: OZIMOKVC [WUSCAR] 05921931 (Generated: 08/14/2023 08:52:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ED JONGSMA - OZIMOKVC

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420189 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 613 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.0 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 73 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.4 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 62 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 58 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.6 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 12 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 32 --- --- ---Copper ppm 11 --- --- ---Lead ppm 3 --- --- ---Tin ppm 4 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 46 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 41 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1478 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 679 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1146 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 957 --- --- ---Barium ppm 27 --- --- ---Boron ppm 44 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: OZIMOKVC [WUSCAR] 05921931 (Generated: 08/14/2023 08:53:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ED JONGSMA - OZIMOKVC
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 633335\Diesel Engine [VCP420189] 27 Jul 2023 @ 613.0 hrs

