
[[580221]] VOLVO L110H 631108 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP422694
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 580221

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: ROBERT TURNERrturner@ripatampa.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a high amount ofparticulates present in the oil. The oilviscosity is higher than normal. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10602069Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 14 Aug 2023
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05922122 (Generated: 08/14/2023 12:03:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP422694 VCP385306 VCP310936 VCP293544Sample Date 20 Jul 2023 27 Oct 2022 29 Jun 2021 19 Dec 2020Machine Hours 12148 11060 9223 7981Oil Hours 4000 3000 1223 4000Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 53.9 53.4 49.8 51.4Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.38 0.36 0.397 0.338
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 59439 69659 11007 23648Particles >6µm 9618 17034 1776 1198Particles >14µm 719 1888 140 109ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/20/17 23/21/18 21/18/14 22/17/14Silicon ppm 4 3 2 4Sodium ppm 2 1 1 1Potassium ppm 0 0 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 10 8 18Copper ppm 2 2 2 4Lead ppm <1 1 <1 1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm 2 2 1 2Molybdenum ppm 2 2 1 2Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 0 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 121 130 115 102Magnesium ppm 8 10 6 9Zinc ppm 450 440 466 423Phosphorus ppm 369 363 360 311Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm <1 4 5 4

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05922122 (Generated: 08/14/2023 12:03:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 631108\Hydraulic System [VCP422694] 20 Jul 2023 @ 12148.0 hrs

