
[[SPM593166]] SENNEBOGAN 835ME 835.0.2566 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP423143
Oil Type: EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT
Job No: SPM593166

BELSON STEEL1685 N STATE RTE 50BOURBONNAIS, ILUS  60914Contact: M. POZANmpozan@belsonsteel.comT: (815)932-7416F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend drain/flush system,and refill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. Appearance is unacceptable.Sediment present. Carboxylate testfailed. The glycol level is acceptable.The pH level of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: BELBOUUnique No: 10602570Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 14 Aug 2023
Report Id: BELBOU [WUSCAR] 05922623 (Generated: 08/14/2023 22:39:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: M. POZAN - BELBOU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423143 --- --- ---Sample Date 04 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 10070 --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.69 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 54.1 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -45 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance sediment --- --- ---Coolant Color DkGry --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BELBOU [WUSCAR] 05922623 (Generated: 08/14/2023 22:39:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: M. POZAN - BELBOU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGAN SENNEBOGAN 835ME 835.0.2566\Coolant [VCP423143] 04 Aug 2023 @ 10070.0 hrs

