
[[M07000016]] FORD F750 38399 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP407789
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: M07000016

McClung-Logan Virginia LLC- RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. Sodiumand/or potassium levels are high.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. Test forglycol is negative. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 10602579Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 14 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05922632 (Generated: 08/14/2023 13:42:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407789 VCP376336 VCP323960 ---Sample Date 09 Aug 2023 05 Oct 2022 11 Oct 2021 ---Machine Hours 11386 10430 9164 ---Oil Hours 0 0 500 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.9 13.5 14.5 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.2 8.3 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 77 89 87 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.9 0.6 0.9 ---Nitration (PA) % 97 106 102 ---Sulfation (PA) % 59 63 62 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 ---Silicon ppm 32 8 8 ---Sodium ppm 39 17 30 ---Potassium ppm 56 31 44 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 45 32 40 ---Copper ppm 3 1 1 ---Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 11 8 11 ---Chromium ppm 2 2 1 ---Molybdenum ppm 60 65 52 ---Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1351 1229 1182 ---Magnesium ppm 720 756 780 ---Zinc ppm 998 854 893 ---Phosphorus ppm 811 700 718 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 29 24 22 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05922632 (Generated: 08/14/2023 13:42:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	FORD FORD F750 38399\Diesel Engine [VCP407789] 09 Aug 2023 @ 11386.0 hrs

