
[[SPM578836]] VOLVO L180G 19305 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP405772
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46
Job No: SPM578836

COVANTA ONONDAGA LP5801 ROCK CUT RDJAMESVILLE, NYUS  13078Contact: BOB SWEETrsweet@covanta.comT: (315)498-4111F: (315)498-9892
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a light amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: COVJAMUnique No: 10602748Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 14 Aug 2023
Report Id: COVJAM [WUSCAR] 05922801 (Generated: 08/14/2023 09:14:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BOB SWEET - COVJAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP405772 VCP405655 VCP391338 VCP288554Sample Date 08 Aug 2023 03 May 2023 18 Mar 2023 28 Sep 2020Machine Hours 21063 20781 20570 19955Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd N/ASample Status ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.9 43.6 43.7 40.5Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.30 0.37 0.35 0.491
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 10423 8634 11443 ---Particles >6µm 1479 1528 1704 ---Particles >14µm 86 76 71 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/18/14 20/18/13 21/18/13 ---Silicon ppm 2 2 1 4Sodium ppm 1 2 0 8Potassium ppm 2 1 2 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 2 2 9Copper ppm 2 2 2 4Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 1 0 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 0 5Molybdenum ppm 6 8 10 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 0 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 95 93 101 81Magnesium ppm 12 20 19 6Zinc ppm 438 442 449 440Phosphorus ppm 348 342 324 381Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 5 6 6 1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COVJAM [WUSCAR] 05922801 (Generated: 08/14/2023 09:14:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BOB SWEET - COVJAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180G 19305\Hydraulic System [VCP405772] 08 Aug 2023 @ 21063.0 hrs

