
[[SWA319806]] VOLVO L180H 3738 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP370459
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SWA319806

ALTA EQUIPMENT5985 COURT STREET ROADSYRACUSE, NYUS  13206Contact: JIM STRIGLEJIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COMT: (315)437-2611F: (315)434-9471
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a moderate amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The oil viscosity islower than normal. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid.

Depot: VOLVO0142Unique No: 10602749Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05922802 (Generated: 08/14/2023 14:05:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP370459 VCP400535 VCP310185 VCP311533Sample Date 02 Aug 2023 05 Apr 2023 20 Aug 2021 14 May 2021Machine Hours 5583 4945 3471 3023Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd N/A Not ChangdSample Status ATTENTION ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 36.8 37.1 37.7 37.9Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.34 0.35 0.326 0.421
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 8166 48650 17158 5049Particles >6µm 1305 6245 1923 783Particles >14µm 71 244 85 36ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/18/13 23/20/15 21/18/14 20/17/12Silicon ppm 8 7 4 3Sodium ppm 2 2 <1 <1Potassium ppm <1 1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 11 6 5Copper ppm 6 6 5 5Lead ppm 1 0 2 2Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 6 4 6 0Chromium ppm 1 1 1 1Molybdenum ppm 0 0 0 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 40 41 44 62Magnesium ppm 0 1 <1 6Zinc ppm 404 424 450 434Phosphorus ppm 331 331 342 322Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 2 1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05922802 (Generated: 08/14/2023 14:05:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 3738\Hydraulic System [VCP370459] 02 Aug 2023 @ 5583.0 hrs

