
[[SPM578836]] VOLVO L180G 19305 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP405664
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: SPM578836

COVANTA ONONDAGA LP5801 ROCK CUT RDJAMESVILLE, NYUS  13078Contact: BOB SWEETrsweet@covanta.comT: (315)498-4111F: (315)498-9892
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: COVJAMUnique No: 10602880Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 14 Aug 2023
Report Id: COVJAM [WUSCAR] 05922933 (Generated: 08/14/2023 15:15:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BOB SWEET - COVJAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP405664 VCP404608 VCP284689 VCP275836Sample Date 08 Aug 2023 03 May 2023 02 Jul 2020 02 Apr 2020Machine Hours 21063 20781 18967 18229Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd N/A Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.8 43.3 40.5 40.8
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 31 23 12 9Sodium ppm 8 5 6 3Potassium ppm <1 <1 3 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 59 40 10 6Copper ppm <1 2 <1 0Lead ppm <1 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 3 <1 1 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 3 3 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 2 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4136 3935 4060 4060Magnesium ppm 29 26 11 10Zinc ppm 1615 1596 1518 1662Phosphorus ppm 1318 1270 1310 1244Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0Boron ppm 179 131 118 118

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COVJAM [WUSCAR] 05922933 (Generated: 08/14/2023 15:15:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BOB SWEET - COVJAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180G 19305\Rear Axle [VCP405664] 08 Aug 2023 @ 21063.0 hrs

