
[[SPM578836]] VOLVO L180G 19305 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP417430
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: SPM578836

COVANTA ONONDAGA LP5801 ROCK CUT RDJAMESVILLE, NYUS  13078Contact: BOB SWEETrsweet@covanta.comT: (315)498-4111F: (315)498-9892
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: COVJAMUnique No: 10602903Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 14 Aug 2023
Report Id: COVJAM [WUSCAR] 05922956 (Generated: 08/14/2023 15:46:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BOB SWEET - COVJAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417430 VCP405658 VCP401392 VCP288549Sample Date 08 Aug 2023 03 May 2023 18 Mar 2023 28 Sep 2020Machine Hours 21063 20781 20570 19594Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd N/A N/ASample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 30.9 32.5 28.7 26.8
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 7 15 22 3Sodium ppm 4 8 9 1Potassium ppm 5 12 16 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 21 23 23 187Copper ppm 2 5 5 5Lead ppm 0 0 0 2Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 0 <1 <1Chromium ppm 0 0 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 3 <1 0Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 2 2 1Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 77 79 70 91Magnesium ppm 6 8 5 1Zinc ppm 87 168 33 20Phosphorus ppm 244 234 166 172Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 91 37 61 67

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COVJAM [WUSCAR] 05922956 (Generated: 08/14/2023 15:46:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BOB SWEET - COVJAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180G 19305\Transmission (Auto) [VCP417430] 08 Aug 2023 @ 21063.0 hrs

