
[[133900]] VOLVO A25G 740046 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP410081
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46
Job No: 133900

FCS CONSTRUCTION LLCPO BOX 190829DALLAS, TXUS  75219Contact: SHANE WHITEWOODswhitewood@friscocs.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. We wereunable to perform a particle countdue to a high concentration ofparticles present in this sample.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: FCSDALUnique No: 10603270Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 15 Aug 2023
Report Id: FCSDAL [WUSCAR] 05923323 (Generated: 08/15/2023 12:12:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SHANE WHITEWOOD - FCSDAL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP410081 VCP371699 VCP314139 VCP322668Sample Date 01 Aug 2023 17 Nov 2022 27 May 2022 28 May 2021Machine Hours 9169 8779 8446 7406Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 46.5 43.3 42.2 44.3Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.61 0.39 0.37 0.453
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm --- 14616 560 3576Particles >6µm --- 769 90 473Particles >14µm --- 33 13 32ISO 4406:1999 (c) --- 21/17/12 16/14/11 19/16/12Silicon ppm 1 3 1 3Sodium ppm 2 2 1 <1Potassium ppm <1 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 11 3 6Copper ppm 2 4 2 6Lead ppm 2 2 <1 2Tin ppm <1 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 0Chromium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 1 0 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 0 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 386 187 54 81Magnesium ppm 13 2 0 7Zinc ppm 550 440 444 425Phosphorus ppm 449 385 341 309Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 <1 1 2

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: FCSDAL [WUSCAR] 05923323 (Generated: 08/15/2023 12:12:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SHANE WHITEWOOD - FCSDAL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 740046\Hydraulic System [VCP410081] 01 Aug 2023 @ 9169.0 hrs

