
[[133900]] VOLVO A25G 740046 - BRAKE

Sample No: VCP410093
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 133900

FCS CONSTRUCTION LLCPO BOX 190829DALLAS, TXUS  75219Contact: SHANE WHITEWOODswhitewood@friscocs.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: FCSDALUnique No: 10603754Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 15 Aug 2023
Report Id: FCSDAL [WUSCAR] 05923807 (Generated: 08/15/2023 17:07:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SHANE WHITEWOOD - FCSDAL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP410093 VCP371706 VCP314057 VCP322656Sample Date 01 Aug 2023 17 Nov 2022 27 May 2022 28 May 2021Machine Hours 9169 8779 8446 7406Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 51.4 52.2 52.2 51.6
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 17 16 14 20Sodium ppm 2 3 6 3Potassium ppm 2 2 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 31 28 26 26Copper ppm 531 514 426 334Lead ppm <1 1 6 1Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 3 <1 1 0Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 1 1 <1Nickel ppm 2 0 1 1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 2 2 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2538 2640 2438 2933Magnesium ppm 7 8 10 8Zinc ppm 991 1020 965 1221Phosphorus ppm 1032 1066 990 1038Barium ppm 2 0 0 0Boron ppm 47 45 68 134

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: FCSDAL [WUSCAR] 05923807 (Generated: 08/15/2023 17:08:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SHANE WHITEWOOD - FCSDAL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 740046\Brake [VCP410093] 01 Aug 2023 @ 9169.0 hrs

