
VOLVO EC220EL 314599 - FRONT RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP417769
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT5985 COURT STREET ROADSYRACUSE, NYUS  13206Contact: JIM STRIGLEJIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COMT: (315)437-2611F: (315)434-9471
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in theoil. The oil viscosity is higher thannormal. Additive levels indicate theaddition of a different brand, or typeof oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0142Unique No: 10603762Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 16 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05923815 (Generated: 08/16/2023 13:13:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417769 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1187 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 170 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 13 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 9 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 355 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 5 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 13 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 11 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 518 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 12 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 05923815 (Generated: 08/16/2023 13:13:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220EL 314599\Front Right Final Drive [VCP417769] 10 Aug 2023 @ 1187.0 hrs

