
[[WO7013061]] VOLVO L90E 67920 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP407217
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: WO7013061

McClung-Logan Virginia LLC- RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Light fuel dilution occurring. Noother contaminants were detected inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 10603841Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 16 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05923894 (Generated: 08/16/2023 08:52:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407217 VCP372988 VCP245654 VCP321337Sample Date 31 Jul 2023 25 Jul 2022 09 Mar 2022 03 Aug 2021Machine Hours 6146 5746 5432 4732Oil Hours 500 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL SEVERE ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.0 11.5 11.59 11.4Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.4 8.3 6.6 ---Oxidation (PA) % 66 59 81 74
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.3 0.4 0.3Nitration (PA) % 82 67 96 90Sulfation (PA) % 52 54 59 58Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 5.6 4.5 10.4 7.1Silicon ppm 4 3 3 2Sodium ppm 3 <1 2 3Potassium ppm 2 0 0 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 5 7 5Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm <1 <1 1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm <1 2 2 0Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 54 73 40 45Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1392 1539 1165 1214Magnesium ppm 774 396 717 595Zinc ppm 971 1055 752 777Phosphorus ppm 729 841 658 656Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 38 104 31 33

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 05923894 (Generated: 08/16/2023 08:52:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90E 67920\Diesel Engine [VCP407217] 31 Jul 2023 @ 6146.0 hrs

