
[[9339]] VOLVO A25F 80082 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP413948
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 9339

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO INC MAIN4601 WASHINGTON BOULEVARDBALTIMORE, MDUS  21227Contact: MARK CIULLAmciulla@mcclung-logan.comT: (410)242-6500F: (410)242-7835
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. We advise that youcheck the air filter, air inductionsystem, and any areas where dirt mayenter the component. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a high amount offuel present in the oil. Elementallevels of silicon (Si) and aluminum(Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarsedirt) ingress. Fuel is present in the oiland is lowering the viscosity. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: VOLVO0150Unique No: 10603846Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 16 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 05923899 (Generated: 08/16/2023 09:44:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413948 --- --- ---Sample Date 09 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 7668 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.5 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 56 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 68 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 49 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 8.4 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 22 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 19 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 51 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1082 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 942 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1188 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 971 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 70 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 05923899 (Generated: 08/16/2023 09:44:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25F 80082\Diesel Engine [VCP413948] 09 Aug 2023 @ 7668.0 hrs

