
[[W14529]] VOLVO L110H 632072 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP404664
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: W14529

HOUSBY HEAVY EQUIPMENT, LLC4410 SE 4 MILE DRANKENY, IAUS  50021Contact: RANDY VANDERLEESTrvanderleest@housby.comT: F: (515)964-2865
Diagnosis
We advise that you perform a filterservice, and use off-line filtration toimprove the cleanliness of the systemfluid. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of particulates (2 to 100microns in size) present in the oil. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The oil is still serviceable providedthat the contaminant(s) can bereduced to acceptable levels.

Depot: VOLVO0080Unique No: 10604100Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 15 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0080 [WUSCAR] 05924153 (Generated: 08/15/2023 12:50:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY VANDERLEEST - VOLVO0080

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP404664 VCP426784 VCP382883 VCP384235Sample Date 07 Aug 2023 02 May 2023 10 Feb 2023 08 Nov 2022Machine Hours 4539 4013 3531 3030Oil Hours 500 2000 500 1000Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.5 41.4 41.9 41.3Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.35 0.37 0.37 0.49
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 9343 7742 7473 10280Particles >6µm 3166 736 1730 1577Particles >14µm 268 20 59 43ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/19/15 20/17/11 20/18/13 21/18/13Silicon ppm 2 3 3 3Sodium ppm 2 0 2 0Potassium ppm 0 2 <1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 6 6 7Copper ppm <1 3 2 3Lead ppm 0 1 1 2Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 0 0 0 <1Chromium ppm <1 2 2 2Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 2Manganese ppm 0 0 0 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 130 81 75 110Magnesium ppm 4 6 5 8Zinc ppm 461 465 434 467Phosphorus ppm 368 350 333 347Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm <1 0 0 2

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0080 [WUSCAR] 05924153 (Generated: 08/15/2023 12:50:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY VANDERLEEST - VOLVO0080
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 632072\Hydraulic System [VCP404664] 07 Aug 2023 @ 4539.0 hrs

