
[[W14529]] VOLVO L110H 632072 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP406595
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: W14529

HOUSBY HEAVY EQUIPMENT, LLC4410 SE 4 MILE DRANKENY, IAUS  50021Contact: RANDY VANDERLEESTrvanderleest@housby.comT: F: (515)964-2865
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0080Unique No: 10604478Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 15 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0080 [WUSCAR] 05924531 (Generated: 08/15/2023 16:22:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY VANDERLEEST - VOLVO0080

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP406595 VCP426785 VCP381651 VCP384236Sample Date 07 Aug 2023 02 May 2023 10 Feb 2023 08 Nov 2022Machine Hours 4539 4013 3531 3030Oil Hours 500 2000 500 1000Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.5 38.5 61.2 40.6
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 17 14 13 17Sodium ppm 3 4 4 10Potassium ppm <1 3 3 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 126 444 420 588Copper ppm 0 3 3 2Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 1Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 2 0 1 2Chromium ppm 2 7 7 9Molybdenum ppm 5 12 12 17Nickel ppm 0 2 2 4Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 11 11 15Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3454 2269 2316 3798Magnesium ppm 33 11 11 18Zinc ppm 1442 1105 1087 1515Phosphorus ppm 1128 929 906 1286Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 122 79 71 116

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0080 [WUSCAR] 05924531 (Generated: 08/15/2023 16:22:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY VANDERLEEST - VOLVO0080
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 632072\Rear Axle [VCP406595] 07 Aug 2023 @ 4539.0 hrs

