
[[580811 CARLETON]] SENNEBOGEN 825 825.0.3362 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP415292
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 580811 CARLETON

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL ELZERMANpaul.elzerman@altaequipment.comT: (248)356-5200F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
We advise that you perform a filterservice, and use off-line filtration toimprove the cleanliness of the systemfluid. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of particulates (2 to 100microns in size) present in the oil. Thesystem cleanliness is above theacceptable limit for the target ISO4406 cleanliness code. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. The oil is stillserviceable provided that thecontaminant(s) can be reduced toacceptable levels.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 10604746Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 16 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 05924799 (Generated: 08/16/2023 09:53:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415292 VCP294218 VCP294219 VCP293804Sample Date 08 Aug 2023 13 Feb 2021 12 Feb 2021 02 Feb 2021Machine Hours 2035 0 487 464Oil Hours 2035 40 6 2Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.0 44.6 45.4 42.8Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.58 0.697 0.750 0.865
 CONTAMINATIONWater % --- --- --- 0.255Particles >4µm 19561 2387 11709 ---Particles >6µm 5507 568 1278 ---Particles >14µm 437 54 35 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/20/16 18/16/13 21/17/12 ---Silicon ppm 2 <1 0 2Sodium ppm 28 24 12 53Potassium ppm 2 1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 2 1 4Copper ppm 3 <1 <1 2Lead ppm 3 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 0Chromium ppm 0 0 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 3 4 1Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Manganese ppm 0 0 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 173 248 196 387Magnesium ppm 36 38 55 16Zinc ppm 473 518 480 552Phosphorus ppm 384 408 382 461Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm <1 4 6 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 05924799 (Generated: 08/16/2023 09:53:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 825 825.0.3362\Hydraulic System [VCP415292] 08 Aug 2023 @ 2035.0 hrs

