
[[SPM593827]] VOLVO ECR235 311787 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP417683
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: SPM593827

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. All other componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10605060Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 16 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05925113 (Generated: 08/16/2023 16:56:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417683 VCP319776 --- ---Sample Date 08 Aug 2023 15 Sep 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 2592 1063 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 184 182 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 74 34 --- ---Sodium ppm 1 4 --- ---Potassium ppm 6 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1127 694 --- ---Copper ppm <1 1 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 10 8 --- ---Chromium ppm 29 21 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 3 --- ---Nickel ppm 1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 16 12 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 48 42 --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 2 --- ---Zinc ppm 10 26 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 369 396 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 0 12 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05925113 (Generated: 08/16/2023 16:56:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR235 311787\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP417683] 08 Aug 2023 @ 2592.0 hrs

