
[[SWA275711-10]] VOLVO L70H 623404 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP396049
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: SWA275711-10

DENALI WE CARE400 TORNE RDHILLBURN, NYUS  10931Contact: Service Manager
T: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: DENHILUnique No: 10605165Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 16 Aug 2023
Report Id: DENHIL [WUSCAR] 05925218 (Generated: 08/16/2023 22:11:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - DENHIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP396049 VCP367841 VCP376096 VCP322248Sample Date 09 Jun 2023 15 Dec 2022 15 Aug 2022 16 May 2022Machine Hours 8270 7328 6731 6283Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.01 7.02 7.01 7.06Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 NT 0 0Percentage Glycol % 51.4 51.1 50.9 50.7Freezing Point °C -38 -38 -35 -35
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal normal normal normalCoolant Color Yllow Yllow Yllow Yllow

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DENHIL [WUSCAR] 05925218 (Generated: 08/16/2023 22:11:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - DENHIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 623404\Coolant [VCP396049] 09 Jun 2023 @ 8270.0 hrs

