
[[1427 COFFMAN]] VOLVO A45G 353362 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP424017
Oil Type: DEXRON III
Job No: 1427 COFFMAN

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT22099 KNABE ROADCORONA, CAUS  92883Contact: ROBERT KNIGHTrobert.knight@vcesvolvo.comT: F: (951)277-4550
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Elemental levels of silicon(Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO4486Unique No: 10605640Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 17 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 05925693 (Generated: 08/17/2023 13:01:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT KNIGHT - VOLVO4486

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424017 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 612 --- --- ---Oil Hours 612 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 21 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 28 --- --- ---Copper ppm 14 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 12 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 95 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 13 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 212 --- --- ---Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 84 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 05925693 (Generated: 08/17/2023 13:01:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT KNIGHT - VOLVO4486
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 353362\Transmission (Auto) [VCP424017] 11 Aug 2023 @ 612.0 hrs

