
VOLVO L110H 631695 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP414224
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No:

COVANTA350 FLAKENBURG ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (813)684-5688F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.The aluminumlevel is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.Light fuel dilution occurring. Fuel ispresent in the oil and is lowering theviscosity.

Depot: COVTAMUnique No: 10605779Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 22 Aug 2023
Report Id: COVTAM [WUSCAR] 05925832 (Generated: 08/22/2023 21:20:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER ? - COVTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414224 VCP407841 VCP386202 VCP353964Sample Date 11 Jul 2023 26 May 2023 07 Nov 2022 19 Aug 2022Machine Hours 19050 18421 17370 16204Oil Hours 0 1000 500 500Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.2 13.1 13.7 14.5Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.8 9.0 10.4 7.3Oxidation (PA) % 84 92 103 150
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.6 0.6 0.6 1.7Nitration (PA) % 78 86 103 142Sulfation (PA) % 62 64 71 97Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 4.8 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 19 28 34 59Sodium ppm 2 3 2 3Potassium ppm 1 <1 1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 26 34 99Copper ppm <1 2 3 7Lead ppm <1 1 2 6Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 2Aluminum ppm 15 25 17 41Chromium ppm 1 1 2 4Molybdenum ppm 45 80 48 44Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 3Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1661 1636 1828 1794Magnesium ppm 531 598 580 534Zinc ppm 1173 1118 1230 1214Phosphorus ppm 950 933 1010 973Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 23 50 19 23

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COVTAM [WUSCAR] 05925832 (Generated: 08/22/2023 21:20:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER ? - COVTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 631695\Diesel Engine [VCP414224] 11 Jul 2023 @ 19050.0 hrs

