
VOLVO ECR145E 314490 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP0007512
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 90W140
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: SHAWN NORTHCRAFTshawn.northcraft@altg.comT: (904)737-6000F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. All other metal levels aretypical for a new componentbreaking in. Elemental level of silicon(Si) above normal indicating ingressof seal material. The condition of theoil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 10606412Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 17 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 05926465 (Generated: 08/18/2023 15:35:40) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0007512 VCP0002525 --- ---Sample Date 11 Aug 2023 27 Jun 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 2999 2042 --- ---Oil Hours 2999 2042 --- ---Oil Changed N/A N/A --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 252 329 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 254 7 --- ---Sodium ppm 4 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 871 125 --- ---Copper ppm 2 <1 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm <1 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm 7 1 --- ---Chromium ppm 28 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 3 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 9 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 80 14 --- ---Magnesium ppm 18 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 51 11 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 799 472 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 74 55 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 05926465 (Generated: 08/18/2023 15:35:43) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR145E 314490\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP0007512] 11 Aug 2023 @ 2999.0 hrs

